
Introduction: Although the etiological diagnosis of loss of con-
sciousness is essentially based on a careful history and clinical
examination, electroencephalography (EEG) remains an important
investigative tool.
Objectives: The aim of this study was to identify the value of
EEG in the management of adolescents with recurrent bouts of
fainting
Methods: This was a retrospective descriptive study conducted
from January 2019 to May 2022. We included all adolescents
referred to the functional explorations department at Habib
Bourguiba hospital, Tunisia for Electroencephalogram (EEG) as
part of a workup to explore recurrent episodes of loss of con-
sciousness.
Results:A total of 55 adolescents were included in this study, with a
mean age of 15.4±2.3 and a 72.4% female proportion.The delay
between the EEG and the onset of the seizure was greater than one
week.67.3% of patients were referred by the child psychiatry depart-
ment.29.1% of the 55 EEG reports were pathological. Epileptiform
discharges were noted in 56.3% of adolescents. Slow waves were
found in 43.7% of cases. The location of the abnormalities was
predominantly frontal. Patients with temporal EEG anomalies had
a notion of ascending epigastric pain preceding loss of conscious-
ness in 90% of cases. Adolescents with EEGs containing epilepti-
form abnormalities had a history of paroxysmal movements in 30%
of cases. The sensitivity of the EEGwas estimated to be around 25%,
and the specificity around 79%.
Conclusions:Although the clinical examination is of great import-
ance in the etiological diagnosis of loss of consciousness, the EEG
remains a complementary examination of non-negligible interest in
the etiological investigation.
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Introduction: In the year 2021, there was a notable increase in
behaviors associated with anxiety, depression, and stress among
school-aged children and adolescents, possibly attributed to the
pervasive effects of social isolation and confinement measures.
Objectives: This study conducted a thorough analysis of cases
involving students aged 11 to 17 years who exhibited risk factors,
anxious and depressive symptoms, and mood disturbances.
Methods: This study focused on students aged 11 to 17 years and
employed a comprehensive approach to assess the impact of anx-
iety, depression, and stress. Cases were meticulously analyzed, and
key categories were established to characterize the multifaceted
challenges faced by the students. These categories included the
availability of family support, utilization of psychopharmacological

treatment, engagement in psychological therapies, participation in
psychopedagogical interventions, and patterns of school absentee-
ism.
Results: The analysis revealed a concerning prevalence of anxiety,
depression, and stress-related symptoms among the student popu-
lation. Many students exhibited risk factors that warranted imme-
diate attention, including social isolation, disrupted routines, and
uncertainty about the future. Furthermore, a significant portion of
students displayed anxious and depressive symptoms, often leading
to altered mood and behavioral challenges. In the context of family
support, it was apparent that students with robust familial backing
tended to cope more effectively with the psychological strain
induced by the pandemic. However, a noteworthy number of
students lacked adequate family support systems, exacerbating
theirmental health struggles. Students in need of such interventions
benefited significantly from their implementation, demonstrating
improved emotional well-being and a reduction in symptom sever-
ity. Nonetheless, the accessibility of these services remained a
concern, with disparities in access evident among different demo-
graphic groups. Psychopedagogical interventions played a pivotal
role in addressing issues related to school absenteeism and facili-
tating a smoother transition to remote learning. Students who
engaged in these interventions showed positive progress in terms
of school attendance and academic performance.
Conclusions:The findings of this study underscore the urgency of a
holistic approach to addressing anxiety, depression, and stress in
school-aged children and adolescents. It is imperative that consult-
ations with child and adolescent psychiatry specialists be conducted
promptly and in a manner that considers the unique contextual
factors influencing each student’s mental health. Moreover, efforts
should be directed toward enhancing family support, expanding
access to psychopharmacological treatment and psychological ther-
apies, and promoting the implementation of psychopedagogical
interventions.
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Introduction: Nonsuicidal self-injury (NSSI) is a self-damaging
behavior with typical onset in early adolescence, and shows greater
prevalence in females. NSSI is defined by recurrent episodes of
intentional self-inflicted damage to body tissue, without suicidal
intent. These recurring self-inflicted injuries are done by the indi-
vuduel to relief oneself from negative feelings, to resolve interper-
sonal difficulties, or to induce positive feelings.
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NSSI in DSM-5. has been included among the conditions in need of
further study.
NSSI can be interpreted as a maladaptive coping mechanism that
can be regarded as an emotional dysregulation. Adverse childhood
experiences including physical abuse, neglect or sexual abuse are
the strongest predictors of theNSSI. Research has repetitively found
strong associations between NSSI and identity diffusion and/or
distorted personality traits.
Objectives: The aim of our study was to assess the association
between childhood traumatization, personality characteristics
including stages of identity development, and self-injurious behav-
ior among female adolescents that experience difficulties with
emotional regulation.
Methods: We compared our results to a Hungarian normative
sample. The sample consisted of inpatients adolescents, age
between 14 and 18, with a diagnosis consisting of „Emotional
disorders with onset specific for childhood” or „Mixed disorders
of conduct and emotions” with chronic nonsuicidal self-injurious
behavior.
Childhood traumatization was measured with the short version of
Childhood Trauma Questionnaire (H-CTQ-SF). Identity develop-
ment and identity diffusion were measured with the Assessment of
Identity Development in Adolescence Questionnaire (AIDA).
Temperament and character factors were measured with the Junior
Temperament and Character Inventory (JTCI).
Results: Adolescent patients with NSSI reported severe and multi-
plex childhood traumatization. These patients scored higher on
novelty seeking and harm avoidance and scored lower on the
persistence, self-directedness, and cooperativeness factors in the
JTCI. These results were compared with the Hungarien normative
sample. Adolescents scored higher on the Discontinuity and Inco-
herence scales of the AIDA.
Conclusions: Our preliminary results suggest that childhood trau-
matization predicts self-injurious behavior in adolescent females.
Additionally, we have found associations between signs indicative
of personality disorder, including lower level of self-cohesion, self-
integration and self-directedness.
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Introduction: Autism spectrum disorders (ASD) is a neurodeve-
lopmental disorder with an estimated lifetime prevalence of at least
1%. Some studies suggest that approximately 60% of children with
ASD show emotional dysregulation and 44-86% sleeping disorders.
Studies suggest that cognitive behavioral therapy and animal-
assisted therapy AAT can be an intervention strategy to promote
emotional and behavioral dysregulation and sleep disturbances.

Objectives:The purpose of this study was to investigate the effect of
a therapy program assisted with dogs (AAT) together with cogni-
tive behavioral therapy (CBT) on behavioral and emotional regu-
lation and sleep disorders in children diagnosed with ASD.
Methods: The sample was composed of 24 children between 7 and
10 years old diagnosed with ASD randomized into two groups
(CGT group (control group) and AAT + CBT group (experimental
group). Inclusion criteria: communication level of simple sen-
tences, mild-moderate difficulties in behavioral and emotional
regulation and sleep disturbances. Exclusion criteria: intellectual
disability, children with specific dogs phobia. Assessment included
ADOS-2, WISC-V, CGAS. dysregulation profile of Achenbach
scale and Sleep Disturbance Scale for Children-Bruni. A program
of 12 sessions (weekly one-hour sessions) focusing emotional and
behavioral regulation and sleep disturbance was designed (Behav-
ior Emotional Sleep Treatment Program. A pre-post evaluation was
performed.
Results: Participants were 20 boys and 2 girls (2 participants
dropped out), with a mean age of 9. Regarding the socio-demo-
graphic and clinical characteristics, no significant differences has
been observed between both groups in the global functioning
measured with the Children’s Global Assessment scale (CGAS)
(p=0.832), nor in the cognitive capacity (QI ) neither in reference
to the associated comorbidities (p=0.103) nor in the variable pre-
scription pharmacological treatment (p= 0.142). In emotional self-
regulation, a significant improvement in emotional regulation dif-
ficulties was observed after treatment in both groups (experimental
group: p=0.014; control group: p=0.012). However, the comparison
between the pre-post intervention results between groups, regard-
ing the emotional regulation variable, a greater improvement is
observed in the experimental group (p=0.013). Significant
improvements were also observed in sleep disorders (Bruni scale
total score and in the sleep conciliation andmaintenance difficulties
scale) in both groups.
Conclusions: To conclude, although this is a pilot study with a
small sample size and further research is needed, results suggest that
a therapy program assisted with therapy dogs and CBT have
positive effects on emotional dysregulation and sleep disturbances
in children with ASD and offers a possible intervention strategy.
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Introduction: Antipsychotic use for adolescents (defined here as
under 25 year olds) must be done with caution, giving due thought
to advantages and potential side effects. Antipsychotics are
extremely useful and effective drugs, but have side effects andmany
of these are problematic.
It has been noted that Risperidone is often used for this age group,
despite the UK guidance being cautious about its use.
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