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greater 01 less probabilitj. But a corninuiiist has no opinions He has 
absolute certainties. H e  possesses the whole and the onlj- truth. As a 
matter of tactics he may profess this or that opinion in order to  
deceive and so actitely help on the evolution of matter towards its 
final consummation of perfect i in i~  ersal (’ommnnism. Rut this is 
merely the use of a ineans towards the end. 

A11 this may seem crude to  us. But unless me recogriise that it is 
the doctrine which ernpregiiates the leaders of Communism and that 
they axe prepared to go to an3 length to preserve its inhuman 
orthodoxy, it is useless to  treat it as merely one of the ‘isms’, which 
disturb the harmonj imd smooth working of the United Nations. 

For these reaslons Don Stureo’s book is as much use to us as 
Guilther’s I n d e  Europe  waq before the war. TVe expected more. 

P. J .  FLOOD 

PLAN YOUR OWN hmrsmms. By A1 P. Fogarty. (Blitckwell; 25s.) 
There would appear t o  be two lines of polic! struggling ior expes-  

siori not only in the Labour part? but also nrnong its opponents. On 
the one side there is the easy policy of abuse and enmity, the policy, 
open or disguised of the class-war. On the other there is the derriand 
for the continued and close co-operation of management and workers. 
This line of policy was already firmly establiihed when the present 
government came into power, but it is very much to  the credit of meii 
such as Sir Stafforcl Cripps that such stress has been laid on its 
implications and that its development has received such emphatic 
backing. Before the war the rise of development bodies, such as the 
Cumberland Development Council and the National Development 
Council of Wales, provided one of the few relatively encouraging 
features of a bleak industrial landscape. They represented a real 
attempt a t  a unification of forces for the building up of industry and 
trade-in a particular region. Today they may be said to  have overcome 
their teething troubles and to have reached the stage when the>- are 
capable of playing an important part in the new era of planned iiidus- 
trialism which is upon us. Mr Fogarty’s book, then, comes at exactly 
the right time. It aims at estimating €he place which developnieiit 
councils can take in the machinery of economic planning. There is 
no need to  stress the vital importance of the answer to this question 
to all those Catholics who are concerned to see the application of the 
principle of subsidiary function-that linch-pin of Christian Demo- 
oracy-to English industry. The book deserves the most careful and 
considered study : i t  is a book of the first importance. 

T. CHARLES EDWARDS 

 HE BYZANTINE 1’.4TRIAKCHATE, 451-1204. By George Every, S.s.11. 

The object of this admira.ble book is to pmvide an introduction to 
Eastern church history after the Council of Chalcedoii and to the 

(S.P.C.K. ; 12s. 6d.) 
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